
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION
APPROX. 
USAGE

MANUFACTURER & 
PRODUCT # PRICE NEGOTIATED PRICING

ITEM 1
48 " SANITARY MANHOLE (0' - 6' DEEP) TO 
INCLUDE BASE AND ONE 12" OPENING 100/ EACH 48B6.0MH $750.00 $750.00

ITEM 2
48" SANITARY MANHOLE RISERS AND 
CONES (OVER 6' DEEP OR RISERS ONLY, 
NO BASE SECTION)

350 VERT. FT 48R0.0MH $100.00 $100.00

ITEM 3 48" FLAT SLAB TOP (6' THICK) 100/ EACH 48T26 $200.00 $200.00

ITEM 4
CON-SEAL CS 231 (14'6" ROLL REQUIRED 
PER JOINT) / EACH MAS.375.CS $25.00 $25.00

ITEM 5 4" MANHOLE BOOTS /EACH S106-7WS $58.00 $58.00
ITEM 6 8" MANHOLE BOOTS /EACH S406-12AWP-EX $67.00 $67.00
ITEM 7 10" MANHOLE BOOTS /EACH S106-16BWP-EX $85.00 $85.00
ITEM 8 12" MANHOLE BOOTS /EACH S106-16AWP-EX $90.00 $90.00
ITEM 9 16" MANHOLE BOOTS /EACH S106-20WS $115.00 $115.00

ITEM 10 18" MANHOLE BOOTS /EACH S206-22 $140.00 $140.00
ITEM 11 7" TO 12" CORES /EACH N/A NO BID NO BID
ITEM 12 16" TO 20" CORES /EACH N/A NO BID NO BID
ITEM 13 24" TO 28" CORES /EACH N/A NO BID NO BID
ITEM 14 2 FT. CONE /EACH 48CC2.0H26.LS $200.00 $200.00
ITEM 15 3 FT. CONE /EACH 48CC.026.LS $300.00 $300.00
ITEM 16 4 FT. CONE /EACH N/A NO BID NO BID
ITEM 17 2 FT. BASE, 48" DIAMETER /EACH 48B2.0OSLS $350.00 $350.00
ITEM 18 3 FT. BASE, 48" DIAMETER /EACH 48B3.0OS.LS $450.00 $450.00
ITEM 19 4 FT. BASE, 48" DIAMETER /EACH 48B4.0O.LS $550.00 $550.00
ITEM 20 COMBINED BASE/CONE UNIT /EACH 48CBC3.5 $550.00 $550.00
ITEM 21 16" MANHOLE RISER---12" /EACH 48R1.0OS.LS $100.00 $100.00
ITEM 22 32" MANHOLE RISER---24" /EACH 48R2.0OSLS $200.00 $200.00
ITEM 23 48" MANHOLE RISER /EACH 48R4.0OS.LS $400.00 $400.00

Bid Tabulation
ITB # 66-19 SEWER MANHOLE COMPONENTS
SANDRA TELLIS, PRINCIPAL BUYER - Ph:205-325-5381/E: telliss@jccal.org 

FOLEY PRODUCTS
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FOLEY PRODUCTS

ITEM 24 48" RISER CONE /EACH 48CRC4.0 $500.00 $500.00

Signature Page

MAXIMUM DISCOUNT
GURANTEED MAXIMUM DISCOUNT AVAILABLE IF CONTRACT IS RENEWED FOR 2ND YEAR 0%
GURANTEED MAXIMUM DISCOUNT AVAILABLE IF CONTRACT IS RENEWED FOR 3RD YEAR  0%

BIDDER AGREES BY BIDDING, THAT ALL OFFERS WILL BE GURANTEED FIRM FOR ORDERS PLACES WITHIN SIXTY (60) DAYS AFTER  

$5,230.00 (Based on quantity of 1 each)GRAND TOTAL:  

ESTIMATED LEAD TIME: 3-5 DAYS

CONTACT INFORMATION
FOLEY PRODUCTS CO./ P.O. BOX 2447, COLUMBUS, GA 31902, KEVIN TRIVETT, 251-525-1484

Notification of Intent to Respond Yes
Non-Collusion Affidavit
EEOC Form

Experience Statement

Debarment Statement
Affidavit of Contractor (E-Verify)
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